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1.‌Purpose
Considering that Iran is an oil-exporting country and its budget is heavily depen-
dent on oil revenues, the unsus tainability of debt and the ever-increasing growth 
of the volume of debts in Iran’s economy can lead to spending the revenues from 
exports to repay debts. To be inves ted. Therefore, to reduce the risk of debt crises, 
the government should try to diversify the economy and sources of income and re-
duce the dependence of the budget on oil revenues. Due to recent events such as oil 
sanctions, reduction in oil prices and the government’s oil revenues, s tagnation in 
various economic sectors has caused more attention to be paid to the issue of gov-
ernment debt. Providing resources in the form of debt from domes tic and foreign 
sources aims to fill the gap between savings and inves tment. But not paying atten-
tion to debt and its role in the process of economic s tability may lead to negative 
effects of debt on inflation and affect economic s tability.

2. Methodology
The present s tudy inves tigates the threshold effects of public debt on the inflation 
rate in Iran’s economy using the Smooth Transition regression model during the pe-
riod 1973 to 2021. The use of the S TR model makes it possible that the relationship 
between public debt and inflation rate depends on the s tate of the economic sys tem, 
and the dynamic equation between them can be uns table and depend on the regime 
and the s tate in which the economy is located. Also, the STR model, in addition to 
being able to specify the number of times and time of regime change, also shows 
the speed of transition from one regime to another regime.

3.‌Findings‌and‌Discussion‌
The es timation results of the linear part of the model (firs t regime) show that the 
variables of economic growth, inves tment, money supply and trade openness have 
a significant and positive effect on the inflation rate in Iran at the confidence level 
of 95%. The results also confirm the exis tence of a negative relationship between 
the government debt rate and trade openness with the inflation rate. The es timation 
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results of the nonlinear part of the model (second regime) show that the variables 
of public debts, trade openness and money supply have positive effects on the in-
flation rate. Also, the economic growth and inves tment variables have a negative 
relationship with the inflation rate. The non-linear and U-shaped effects of public 
debt on inflation are due to debt coverage by oil revenues. In Iran, as a develop-
ing country with natural resource rents, it is faced with the inefficiency and large 
size of the government. To compensate for the s tructural deficit, the government 
creates a capital surplus in the budget by reducing cons truction cos ts and allocates 
the created capital surplus to current expenses. This has long-term negative las ting 
effects on inflation. The continuation of these conditions in the long term can cause 
ins tability of the government’s debts and as a result reduce economic growth and 
increase inflation. The important point is the threshold of public debt, which shows 
the number of 6.55%, which indicates that if the ratio of public debt to GDP exceeds 
the number of 6.55%, the intensification of inflation and its negative effects will be 
more visible.

4. Conclusion and Policy Implications
The results of the inves tigation show that the public debts in the firs t and second 
regimes had a positive effect on the inflation rate, in other words, the accumula-
tion of government debts led to borrowing from the central bank, increasing bank 
liabilities and debts. will increase the money supply and eventually increase the 
inflation rate. Considering that in the pas t years, a significant part of the budget 
deficit in Iran is financed by borrowing from the central bank and creating debt, 
which has a significant expansionary effect on the total demand and the price level, 
it is necessary That the government budget deficit be financed by other means than 
borrowing from the banking sys tem, such as borrowing from the people and selling 
government bonds to the people, rather than creating debt to the central bank and 
other banks. Since in Iran’s economy, the government budget is highly dependent 
on oil export revenues, oil price fluctuations have made it difficult to forecas t oil 
revenues in the budget and have caused random fluctuations in the government bud-
get. Therefore, it is recommended to rely on an economic model without oil in order 
to des tabilize the behavior of the public sector in Iran’s economy. The government 
should be extremely careful in setting the annual budget and by operationalizing the 
budget, it should provide more favorable use of the budget resources as far as possi-
ble to reduce the budget deficit and the accumulation of debts, which have become a 
chronic disease in the Iranian economy has been reduced. One of the solutions that 
can be used to reduce the amount of government debt is to try to increase govern-
ment receipts, the mos t important option being to increase tax revenues. Regarding 
the increase in tax revenue, paying attention to the performance of the government 
shows a significant lack of success in this sector, which can be attributed to the 
legal and executive aspect of the country’s tax sys tem. If the government is able 
to reform the country’s tax s tructure, in such a way that the tax policy is able to 



C

Volume 2, Issue 4, Winter 2024

fulfill its duties, it can be considered as one of the appropriate methods to increase 
the government’s income, reduce the government’s debts and As a result, inflation 
was considered to be contained in the exis ting conditions. Economic growth and 
inves tment have also had a negative effect on the inflation rate in the two regimes. 
Consider production. According to the results of the present s tudy, the degree of 
trade openness will not always have a cons tant and uniform effect on the inflation 
rate, in other words, the extent of the effect of trade openness on inflation is highly 
dependent on the inflation rate, and in higher inflations, and the size of the effect 
will be different. Therefore, the economic policy maker in the country to make a de-
cision on the size of foreign trade, mus t take into account the important fact that the 
increase in foreign trade cannot always improve the domes tic inflation rate, and for 
this important economic variable, the optimal point There will be primary inflation 
and economic s tructure of the country.


